

SAN ANTONIO WATER SYSTEM
 P. O. BOX 2449
 SAN ANTONIO, TEXAS 78298-2449
TABULATION OF BIDS

PROPOSAL Purchase of Nimble Storage Arrays

FOR:

TIME &

DATE: 3:00 p.m., May 13, 2015

ITEM NO. DESCRIPTION AND APPROXIMATE QUANTITY

ITEM NO.	DESCRIPTION AND APPROXIMATE QUANTITY	UNIT	Netsync Network Solutions 901 NE Loop South, Ste. 810 San Antonio, TX 78209	Computer Solutions 814 Arion Pkwy, Ste. 101 San Antonio, TX 78216	Taborda Solutions, Inc. 9580 Oak Ave. Pkwy, Ste. 7-180 Folsom, CA 95630	SHI/Government Solutions, Inc. 1301 S. Mc-Pac Expressway, Ste. 375 Austin, TX 78746	CDW Government, LLC 230 N. Milwaukee Ave. Vernon Hills, IL 60061-9740	Computex Technology Solution 5355 W. Sam Houston Pkwy N, Ste. 390 Houston, TX 77041	En Pointe Technologies Sales, LLC 18701 S. Figueroa Street Gardena, CA 90248-4506	GovConnection, Inc. 732 Milford Road Merrimack, NH 03054	PCPC Direct, Ltd. 10690 Shadow Wood Dr. #132 Houston, TX 77043	Dyonyx, LP 1235 N Loop West, Ste. 1200 Houston, TX 77008	Sirius Computer Solutions, Inc.	Critical Start, LLC	IBM Corporation	Accudata Systems, Inc.	Cloud Sherpas																																			
1.	2 ea. CS300, 2x1 GigE, Dual 10GbE Optical (Qty. 2 pair), 12x2TB HDD 4x300GB SSDs, Nimble Part # CS300-4P-24T-1200F	UNIT PRICE TOTAL	53,317.00 106,634.00	57,000.00 114,000.00	102,772.50 205,545.00	104,846.00 209,692.00	106,325.44 212,650.88	107,052.63 214,105.26	107,567.53 215,135.06	107,266.80 214,533.60	107,350.00 214,700.00	125,296.47 250,592.94	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID																																			
2.	2 ea. 4Hr Parts Del, SW Sup & InfoSight - NextGen Arrays 5 Year Nimble Part #SLA-4HR	UNIT PRICE TOTAL	30,757.84 61,515.68	27,826.00 55,652.00	30,515.00 61,030.00	30,982.00 61,964.00	31,419.33 62,838.66	31,634.22 63,268.44	31,271.64 62,543.28	31,755.35 63,510.70	31,722.10 63,444.20	36,733.40 73,466.80						NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID																														
	TOTAL	TOTAL	168,149.68	169,652.00	266,575.00	271,656.00	275,489.54	277,373.70	Shipping 200.00 277,878.34	278,244.30	Freight 150.00 278,294.20	324,059.74											NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID																									
	DIR Contract Reference		DIR-TSO-2660	DIR-SDD-2035	DIR-SDD-2035	Not Applicable					DIR-SDD-2035																	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID																				
	DIR Contract Expiration Date		Pending	05/03/2017	05/03/2016	Not Applicable					Aug. 7, 2015																						NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID															
	Vendor Name		Netsync Network Solutions	Great South TX Corp. dba Computer Solutions	Taborda Solutions, Inc.	SHI/Gov. Solutions, Inc.	CDW Government, LLC		En Pointe Technologies Sales, LLC	GovConnection, Inc.	PCPC Direct, Ltd.																											NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID										
	Terms		Net 30 days	Net 30 days	Net 30 days	Net 30 days	Net 30 days	Net 30 days	Net 30 days	Net 30 days	Net 30 days	Net 30 days																															NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID					
	Delivery Days																																															NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID

***LOW BIDDER**

BID INVITATIONS WERE E-MAILED TO AND/OR PICKED UP BY:

Accudata Systems, Inc.
 CDW Government
 Cloud Sherpas
 Computer Solutions
 Computer Technology Solution
 Critical Start, LLC
 Dyonyx, LP
 En Pointe Technologies Sales

Gov Connection
 IBM Corporation
 Netsync Network Solutions
 PCPC Direct, Ltd.
 SHI Government Solutions
 Sirius Computer Solutions, Inc.
 Taborda Solutions, Inc.

Demandstar
 SAWS Website